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2025 Chemical Bid Tally Sheet

Opened at 9:00 a.m. 01/17/2025 - by: Mark Grazewski & Keira Lucas

Opening Date: 1/17/2025
Adulticides:
Naled - 87.4% Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Veseris
Dibrom No Bid Dibrom No Bid No Bid
30-90G $ 295.77
90G-120G $ 281.55
120G-2640G $ 277.51 $ 291.53
2640+G $ 276.17 $ 290.13
Pyrethrins - 5.0% or higher, OMRI Listed Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Target Veseris
Merus 3.0 : Evergreen Evergreen ULV <
Mes2nommll OmRD NoBid | uLv Ground Air NoBid
2.5G Jug $ 373.54
$197.00-
30G Drum (Merus 30-275 G) $ 373.54 $235.00| $ 260.00
$186.00- $209.00-
55G Drum (Merus 276-809G) $ 373.54 $219.00 $246.00
275G Tote (Merus 0-2 Totes)(Evergreen 1 Tote) $ 37354 | $ 373.54 $ 215.00| $ 237.00
275G Tote (Merus 3 or more Totes)(Evergreen 2+ Totes) | $ 37354 | $ 370.00 $183.00| $ 202.00
0 ithri D i i
5ASumnthnn,1/oP:alle.thnn;::/;PBO,forunal Prior Year C Clarke Ad IS Veseris
Duet HD Duet HD No Bid No Bid No Bid
per gallon (up to 990 G) $ 251.74
Up to 1,999 G $ 257.28
Up to 2,000 G + $ .219.33
per gallon (991-2009 G) $ 234.00
per gallon (2010G+) $ 209.98
2% Deltamethrin, for aerial applications only Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Target Veseris
Imperium DeltaGard .
No Bid No Bid (Aerial) (Ground) il
2x2.5 G Cases $ 286.00 | $ 286.00
30 G Drums $ 279.00 | $ 279.00
250 G Tote $ 277.00 | $ 277.00
7.9% Bifenthrin Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Target Veseris
Wisdom TC . Wisdom TC | Wisdom TC g
Flowable Nolid Flowable Flowable Bifen 1T B
Per Gallon $ 49.45 $ 5295 | $ 44.70
4x1G Case $ 49.70 $ 52.95 | $ 41.72 $ 48.70
30G/55G Drum $ 47.50 | $ 50.50 | § 47.00
4% Fenprog 1.5% Ab 1% C-8910 Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Veseris
ReMoa Tri No Bid ReMoa Tri No Bid No Bid
5G Pails $ 315.00
30G Drum $ 300.00 $ 300.00
264G Tote $ 295.00 $ 295.00
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Larvicides

B.t.i. Aqueous Suspension - 11.61% or higher Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Target Veseris
Vectobac 12 AS No Bid Vectt;bsac 22 Aquabac XT Fallout LQ Aquabac XT
2x25G Case $ 34.30 $ 39.12 | $ 3470 | $ 3470 | $ 35.50
Under 300 G (30 G Drum) $ 34.30 $ 3875 | % 3470 | § 34.70
55 G Drum $ 34.70
300-999 G $ 34.30 $ 38.75
1,000 G+ $ 34.30 $ 38.75
275G Tote $ 34.70
BTl Water Dispersible Granule — 37.5% or above, g .
tabelic for wiben 1st be OMRI listed Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Veseris
VectoBac WDG . VectoBac Aquabac WDG
(OMRY) No Bid WDG (OMRI) Fallout WDG 3000
Under 500 Ibs $ 37.69 $ 3882 |$ 2650 | $ 30.00
500-4,999 Ibs $ 36.63 $ 37734 $ 2650 | $ 30.00
5,000 +Ibs $ 3577 $ 36.84 | $ 26.50 | $ 30.00
BS Water Dispersible Granule — 7.5% or above Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Veseris
2 Vectolex : :
No Bid WDG (OMRI) No Bid No Bid
24x1 b case $ 67.43
25 |b drums $ 64.01
5,000 + Ibs
B.t.i. Multibrood Granules - 10% or higher Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Veseris
Fourstar Bti CRG F°“g:;’ Bt No Bid No Bid No Bid
Under 500 Ibs $ 14.89 | $ 15.78
500-4,999 Ibs $ 14.89 | $ 15.78
5,000 + Ibs $ 14.25 | § 15.01
1000 Ib Tote $ 13.97
B.t.i. Granules - 2.8% or higher, OMRI Listed Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Target Veseris
Vectobac GR Vectobac Summit BTl | Aquabac 200G | Aquabac 200G
(OMRI) No Bid FG+ (OMRI) Granules (OMRI) (OMRI)
Under 500 Ibs $ 1.85 $ 440 $% 152 | $ 1.75 [ $ 1.80
500-4,999 Ibs $ 1.80 $ 4.40 | $ 152 | $ 175 $ 1.80
5,000 + Ibs (1200 Ib Sack Aquabac) $ 1.78 $ 4.40 | § 152 | $ 1175 | 1.78
B.ti. + BS G les - Any Ci ion, OMRI Listed | Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Veseris
Vectomax FG % Vectomax FG A s
(OMRI) No Bid (OMRI) No Bid No Bid
Under 500 Ibs $ 9.19 $ 9.46
500-4,999 Ibs $ 8.87 $ 9.14
5,000 + 15,999 Ibs $ 8.50 $ 8.75
16000 + Ibs (40 Ib bags or 1200 Ib Supersack) $ 8.25 $ 8.50
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Larvicides Continued - Page 2

B.ti. + Methoprene Granules Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Veseris
2 Vectoprime
Vectoprime FG Duplex G FG Duplex G Duplex G
Under 500 Ibs (bags) $ 437 | $ 16.40 | $ 440 | § 16.40| $ 16.40
500-4,999 Ibs $ 430 | $ 16.40 | $ 440 | § 16.40( $ 16.40
2,000 Ib (totes) or 1200 Ib supersack $ 430 | $ 16.30 | $ 440 | $ 16.30| $ 16.30
5,000+ Ib (Duplex G) $ 16.40 [ $ 440 | § 16.40| $ 16.40
Spinosad Tablets - 6.25% or above Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Veseris
Natular XRT Natular XRT
OMRI OMRI No Bid No Bid No Bid
$1,293.60 &
Under 24 Cases (XRT 220/Case, DT 2500/case) $1,555.00 $ 1,336.40
$1,193.60 &
25+ Cases (XRT 220/Case, DT 2500/case) $1,555.00 $ 1,293.60
Pyriproxyfen Water Soluable Pouch - 0.5% or higher Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Veseris
No Bid No Bid No Bid Sumilarv WSP No Bid
Bag (40/Bag) $ 65.90
Case (400/Case) $ 659.00
BTl + BS Water Soluable Pouch - Any Concentration Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Veseris
Vectomax WSP No Bid Nectomax No Bid No Bid
WSP
Under 24 cases (800/case) $ 1,361.24 $ 1,680.00
25+ cases (800/case) $ 1,317.33 $ 1,610.00
Spinosad Granules - 2.5%, OMRI Listed Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Veseris
Natular G30 Natular G30
(OMRI) (OMRI) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Under 500 Ib ¢ e $ 21.54
40-4,999 Ib $ 2145 | $ 21.54
5,000+ Ib $ 2145 | § 21.54
= dLiguid S s
= El s lorabov OMR e Clarke Adapco Target Veseris
Natular SC
Natular SC (OMRI) (OMRI) No Bid No Bid No Bid
0-75 Jugs (187.5 G) $1,447.58
76 or more Jugs (190 G+) $1,409.12
Under 300 G $1,402.62
300-999 G e
$1,402.62
1,000 G+
Larviciding Oil - 10% Mineral Oil or higher Prior Year Cost Clarke Adapco Target Veseris
BYAz ol Cocobear BVA 2 Oil BVA 20l No Bid
5G pail N/A $ 72.80| § 2258 $ 20.50
30G Drum $ 61.60 N/A
55G Drum $ 17.85 | ¢ 61.60 | $ 22.39 | 15.12
275G Tote $ 16.90 | ¢ 61.60 | $ 2239 | $ 15.92

** | hereby certify that all sealed bids received by the Collier Mosquito Control District

remained unopened until all submissions were received. These bids were opened in thef

presence of the witness indicated below.

htips

Opened By:

Witness: //z/[:)? % g

Date: 1/17/2025

Time: {0 NO AM
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