2026 Chemical Bid Tally Sheet

Opened at 3:00 01/16/2026 -- by: Keira Lucas and Mark Grazewski Opening Date: 1/16/2025
Adulticides:
5 . Pacific Shore
Naled - 87.4% Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco : Target
Holdings, Inc.
Dibrom Dibrom : i
Concentrate e Hefld Concentrate higiBid bhtalls
30G-90G $ 295.77 $ 310.56
120G-2610G $ 291.53 $ 306.11
2640+G $ 290.13 $ 304.64
. ; Pacific Shore
Pyrethrins - 5.0% or higher, OMRI Listed Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco Target Target
Holdings, Inc.
Merus 3.0 : Evergreen ULV| Evergreen ULV
Merus 3.0 (OMRI) (OMRI) No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.25 Ground 5.25 Air
2.5G Jug $ 37354 | $ 418.13
30G Drums (1-4 drums) $ 246.00
30G Drums (5+ drums) $ 209.00
55G Drums (1-3 drums) $ 232.00 | $ 261.00
55G Drums (4+ drums) $ 197.00 | $ 222.00
275G Tote (Merus 0-2 Totes)(Evergreen 1 Tote) 3 37354 | § 418.13 $ 228.00 | $ 252.00
275G Tote (Merus 3 or more Totes)(Evergreen 2+ Totes) $ 370.00 | $ 399.30 $ 194.00 | § 214.00
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5% Sumithrin, 1% PfaHe.thrm, 5% PBO, for aerial Prior Year Cost Clarike Vessiis Adapco Pacnflc Shore Tatqet
applications only Holdings, Inc.
Duet HD Duet HD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Upto 1,999 G $ 257.28 | $ 266.50
Up to 2,000 G+ $ 21933 | § 240.61
1% Deltamethrin, for aerial applications only Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco :zlccli?ncgihlt:\ r(c:a Target Target
: ’ Imperium Deltaguard
Imperium (Aerial) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (Aerial) (Ground)

2x 2.5 G Cases $ 286.00 $ 299.00 | § 299.00

30G Drums $ 279.00 $ 292.00 | $ 292.00

250G Tote $ 277.00 $ 290.00 | $ 290.00

7.9% Bifenthrin Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco Pamflc Shofe Target Target
Holdings, Inc.
Wisdom TC i Wisdom TC : Wisdom TC :
Flowable No Bid B Maxx Pro Flowable No Bid Bl Bifen T

per gallon 3 44.70 $ 51.85| % 52.94 $ 44.70

4x1G Case Per Case $ 41.72 $ 41.72
30G/55G Drum $ 47.50 $ 4470 | $ 50.50
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4% Fenpropathrin, 1.5% Abamectin, 1% C-8910 Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco Pacific Shore Target
Holdings, Inc.
ReMoa Tri No Bid No Bid ReMoa Tri No Bid No Bid
5g Pails $ 315.00 $ 315.00
30G Drum $ 300.00 $ 300.00
275G Tote $ 295.00 $ 300.00
73% Cedarwood Qil, 2% Cinnamon Ol Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco Paclflc Share Target
Holdings, Inc.
Nature-Cide Nature-Cide Nature-Cide
Pest . Pest Pest
NaBld Management Ne Bid Management X2 | Management
X2 Plus Plus X2 Plus
2.5 G Jug $ 172.42 $ 181.50{ $ 174.30
55 G Drum $ 156.75 $ 165.00
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Larvicides

; g o Pacific Shore
B.t.i. Aqueous Suspension - 11.61 % or higher Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco Holdings, Inc. Target
: VectoBac .
Aquabac XT Aquabac XT No Bid 12AS No Bid Fallout LQ
2x2.5 GL Case $ 34.70 | $ 52.50 $ 40.68 $ 36.00
Under 300 Gallons (30 G Drum) $ 3470 | $ 40.00 $ 40.30 $ 36.00
55G Drum $ 40.00 $ 36.00
250G Tote $ 40.00 $ 40.30 $ 36.00
BTI Water Dispersible Granule — 37.5% or above, labelled : Pacific Shore
for urban usage, OMRI listed Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco Holdings, Inc. Target
VectoBac WDG | AquaBac WDG . VectoBac .
(OMRI) 3000 No Bid WDG (OMRI) No Bid Fallout WDG
Under 500 Lbs (Aquabac 40Ib Bag) $ 38.82 | $ 43.25 $ 40.37
500-4,999 Ibs (Aquabac 25Ib Pail) $ 37.73 | $ 43.25 $ 39.24 $ 27.00
5,000 + Ibs_(Aquabac 55Ib Pail) $ 36.84 | $ 45.61 $ 38.31
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BS Water Dispersible Granule — 7.5% or above Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco Pamflc Roan Target
Holdings, Inc.
Vectolex WDG No Bid No Bid Vectolex WDG No Bid No Bid
Under 500 Lbs (1 Ib case) $ 37.69 $ 70.12
500-4,999 Ibs (25 Ib Drums) $ 36.63 $ 66.57
5,000 + Ibs $ 35.77
B.t.i. Multibrood Granules - 10% or higher Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco Faciflc Shiore Target
Holdings, Inc.
Folie ok Fourtarsd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Under 500 Lbs (Fourstar up to 9,999 Ibs) $ 15.78 | $ 16.60
500-4,999 Ibs (Fourstar 10,000+) $ 1578 | 16.21
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B.t.i. Granules - 2.8% or higher, OMRI Listed Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco ::Ii;?ncgi,h;r: Target
Aq“(%bh:;;‘)’ooe Aq“(a(‘)bn:‘ésooe No Bid Ve"(tg':nal‘.\f’l)m* No Bid Summit BTI
Under 500 Lbs (Aquabac up to 9,999 Ibs.) $ 175 % 2.50 $ 4.40 1.60
500-4,999 Ibs (Aquabac 10,000+) $ 1756 | $ 2.30 1.60
5,000 + Ibs (1200 Ib Sack Aquabac) $ 1.75 1.60
B.t.i. + BS Granules - Any Concentration, OMRI Listed Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco ::f:‘;incg:hﬁ‘ r: Target
Ve?:)m::)( Re No Bid No Bid Ve‘;gn“;l’)‘ e No Bid No Bid
Under 500 Lbs 3 9.46 $ 9.84
500-4,999 Ibs $ 9.14 $ 9.51
5,000 + 15,999 $ 8.75 $ 9.10
16000 + Ibs (40 Ib bags or 1200 LB Supersack) $ 8.50 $ 8.84
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B.t.i. + Methoprene Granules Prior Year Cost | Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco Pac'f'c Shore Target
Holdings, Inc.
Vectoprime FG Duplex G Duplex G Duplex G Vectoprime FG No Bid Duplex G
Under 500 Lbs (Duplex 40 Ib bags) $ 440 | $ 16.40 | $ 16.90 | $ 16.90| $ 4.40 $ 16.90
500-4,999 lbs $ 440 | 3 16.40 $ 4.40
2,000 Ib (totes) or 1200 Ib supersack $ 440 | % 16.30 | $ 16.90 | $ 16.90| $ 4.40 $ 16.90
5,000+ Ib (Duplex G) $ 440 | $ 16.40 $ 4.40
Spinosad Tablets - 6.25% or above Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco sng:chih;:‘ r: Target
Natular XRT Natular XRT ‘ :
OMRI OMRI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Under 24 Cases(XRT 220 tabs/Case, DT 2500/case) $ 1,336.40| $ 1,371.22
25+ Cases (XRT 220 tabs/Case, DT 2500/case) $ 1,293.60| $ 1,358.28
Pyriproxyfen Water Soluable Pouch - 0.5% or higher Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco :2::(;::‘09‘:."1'(::-: Target
Sumilarv WSP No Bid S‘\‘,Cg:f”’ No Bid No Bid Sumilarv WSP
400/Case Cost per case $ 659.00 $ 692.50 $ 676.00
Bag of 40 $ 65.90 $ 67.60
BTI + BS Water Soluable Pouch - Any Concentration Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco ::g::g:h;r: Target
: L Vectomax .
Vectomax WSP No Bid No Bid WSP (OMRI) No Bid
under 24 cases (800/case) Cost per case $ 1,680.00 $ 1,744.00
25+ cases (800/case) Cost per case $ 1,610.00 $ 1,672.00
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Spinosad Granules - 2.5%, OMRI Listed Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco Faclfle shore Target
; Holdings, Inc.
Natular G30 Natular G30 . i 5
(OMRI) (OMRI) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Under 10,000 Ibs. $ 2154 | § 23.00

10,000+ $ 2154 | $ 22.94

5,000 +Lb $ 21.54

i iqui jon - 229 bove, OMRI Listed
SpingsadiCiquidiBgsREla s 2aonaboe : Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco Racliic Share Target
3 Holdings, Inc.
Natular SC Natular SC
(OMRI) (OMRI) NoiBid o Bic No Bid
0-75 Jugs (187.5G) $ 1,447.58 $1,500.00
76 or more Jugs (190G+) $ 1,409.12 $1,479.58
Larviciding Oil - 10% Mineral Oil or higher Prior Year Cost Clarke Veseris Adapco Adapco Paclfic Selic Target
Holdings, Inc.
BVA 2 Oil No Bid No Bid BVA 2 Oil SunSpray MLO BVA 2 Oil

5G Pail $ 2050 $ 2348 | % 20.30 $ 19.00

30G Drum

55G Drum $ 1642 $ 2329 | $ 15.10 $ 16.90

275G Tote $ 15.92 $ 23.29 $ 14.60
** | hereby certify that all sealed bids received by the Collier Mosquito Control District
remained unopened until all submissions were received. These bids were opened in the
presence of the witness indicated below. "

Opened By: ‘ & P
L) e -
Witness: /Id &
Date: 1/16/2025
Time: Y:3/) YM
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