2022 Chemical Bid Tally Sheet

Opened at 10:00 a.m. 01/26/2022 -- by: Keira Lucas & Stacy Welch Opening Date: 1/26/2022
Adulticides:
NALED 87.4% Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Target
Dibrom Dibrom No Bid No Bid
less than 120 $ 24554 | $ 255.37
120 to 2,610 $ 24201 $ 251.70
2640+ $ 250.50
Pyrethrins 5.0% or higher Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Target Adapco Target
Evergreen Evergreen
Evergreen *Merus 3.0 Evergreen
*| - -
Mo OMBN | uLv 5-25 AIr ©OMR)) | uLvsasair | Y-V 52 PLY a8
Ground Ground
5 GL Pail $ 251.10 $ 23430 | $ 230.56 | $ 207.45
30 GL Drum (Merus 30-275 G) $ 30542 | $ 240.28 | $ 32166 | $ 224.75 | $ 22631 ($ 203.80
55 GL Drum (Merus 275-809G) $ 25557 | $ 228.77 | $ 27533 | $ 213.40 | $ 21630 [ $ 196.70
275 GL Tote (Merus 810 G or more) $ 24548 | $ 222.23 | $ 25733 | $ 207.45 | $ 21639 [ $ 193.65
* OMRI - Organic Materials Review Institute Approved.
5% Sumithrin + 1% Prallethrin Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Target Clarke
Duet HD No Bid Duet HD No Bid Duet
per gallon (up to 1,9999 G) $ 209.40 $ 223.64 $ 233.06
per gallon (2,000+ G) $ 189.54 $ 199.78 $ 233.06
er gallon $ 233.06
7.9% Bifenthrin Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Target
No Bid Whdom JC No Bid Bifen UT
Flowable
per gallon 4x1 G Cases $ 37.25 $ 47.86
30 G Drum $ 47.24
4.74% Deltamethrin Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Target Target Target
No Bid D-Fense SC No Bid D-Fense SC | Suspend SC S“s"ze;‘ndepmy'
per gallon 4x1 G Case $ 208.32 $ 21500 | $ 310.00 [ $ 366.00
30 G Drum $ 366.00
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Larvicides

B.t.i. (AM6552) - Aqueous Suspension 11.61% or

higher Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Target
Vectobac 12AS | Vectobac 12AS No Bid No Bid
2x25GL Case $ 35.80 | $ 36.87
Under 300 Gallons (30 G Drum) $ 35.80 | $ 35.25
300-999 Gallons $ 3325 (% 34.08
1,000 Gallons or More $ 32751 % 33.55
B.t.i. /Water Dispersible Granules 37.0% or higher | Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Target
VectoBac WDG | VectoBac WDG No Bid No Bid
Under 500 Lbs $ 3450 | $ 35.53
500-4,999 Ibs $ 33.70 | $ 34.54
5,000 + Ibs (1,200 Ibs for Sustain MBG) $ 3290 | % 33.72
B.t.i. Multibrood Granules - 10% or higher Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Target
Fourstar Bti . Fourstar Bti .
CRG No Bid CRG No Bid
Under 500 Lbs $ 12.51 $ 13.01
500-4,999 Ibs $ 12.51 $ 13.01
5,000 + Ibs (1,200 Ibs for Sustain MBG) $ 12.51 $ 13.01
1000 Ib Tote $ 12.50 $ 13.00
B.t.i. + BS Granules - Any Concentration Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Target
Vectomax FG Vectomax FG Fourstar No Bid
(OMRI) (OMRI) MBG
Under 500 Lbs $ 850 |$ 87118 9.42
500-4,999 Ibs $ 8200 § 84118 9.42
5,000 + Ibs (1,200 Ibs for Sustain MBG) $ 8.00 % 8058 9.42
16000 + Ibs (40 Ib bags or 1200 LB Supersack $ 780 | % 7.82
B.t.i. 6.07% + Methoprene Granules 0.10% Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Target
Vectoprime FG | Vectoprime FG| Duplex G Duplex G
Under 500 Lbs (bags) $ 395|8% 4.05 | $ 1496 | $ 14.96
500-4,999 Ibs $ 3.95 (8 39718 1496 | $ 14.96
2,000 Ib (totes) $ 39518 39718 1460 | $ 14.60
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Spinosad Tablets 6.25% or above Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Clarke Clarke Target
Natular DT & i A
Natular XRT & No Bid Natularc DT 1 *tattiaf X1 No Bid
PR OMRI OMRI
DT 12
$1,386.00 &
$1,025.20 &
Under 24 Cases $341.50 $ 1,386.00 | $ 1,075.80
$1,386.00 &
25+ Cases $994.40 $ 1,386.00 | $ 1,047.20
BTI/BS Tablets 1% or above Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Target Clarke Clarke
FourStar 180 | Vectomax WSP { FourStar 45 . FourStar 90 Fourstar 150
No Bid Day - 200 per
Day 800 per case Day Day
case
under 24 cases $ 752.00 | $ 1,271.00 | $ 302.00 $ 502.00 | $ 782.00
25+ cases $ 752.00 | $ 1,230.00 $ 502.00 | $ 782.00
Spinosad Granules 2.5% Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Target
*Natular G30 . *Natular G30 .
OMRI No Bid OMRI No Bid
40 -4,999 Lb $ 16.99 $ 18.01
5,000 + Lb $ 16.99 $ 18.01
Spinosad Liquid S ion 22 bove
B lquid Suspenision 22 or 2boy Prior Year Cost Adapco Clarke Target
Natular SC No Bid Natular SC No Bid
Under 300 Gallons (4x1 C) $1,128.33 $1,196.03
300 - 999 Gallons $1,128.33 $1,136.23
1,000 Gallons or More $1,128.33 $1,076.43
Larviciding Oil - 10% Mineral Oil or higher Prior Year Cost Adapco Clasl:jn::g = Target Adapco
BVA 2 Oil BVA 2 Qil Envirotech BVA 2 Oil Sunspray MLO
5G pail Gallon $ 15.62| $ 2376 | $ 14.50| $ 15.62
55G Drum $ 899 (g 1485 | $ 23.76 | $ 14.50| g 14.85
275G Tote up to 999G $ 899|g 14.44 $ 14.50| g 14.44
275G Tote over 1,000G $ 864| g 14.19 $ 14.50| g 14.19
“7 1 Nerepy cerury tnat ail sealea pias receivea ny .
Opened By: 7 il
7 ~
1 7
Date: 1/26/2022
Time: {0167 AM\
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